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New Hampton, IA - April 2023 — CONEXPO/CON-AGG 2023 was a huge success! We would like to 
thank all our current customers and new contacts who visited us at ConExpo and showed interest in our 
products and our company. The exhibition gave us the opportunity to present the latest in mechanical and 
mechatronic door and window systems. 
 

Here are some of the stats that were shared: 

• 3+ million net square feet of exhibits (10.5% increase over 2020) 

• 139,000+ registered attendees (6% increase over 2020) 

• 2400+ exhibitors, from 36 countries including 603 new companies. 

• 24,000+ international registered attendees from 133 countries 

 

 

 

 

The success of 

CONEXPO-CON/AGG is 

a testament to the 

resilience and strength of 

the construction industry, 

which has continued to 

adapt and innovate 

despite the challenges of 

the past three years. TriMark continues to expand product and platform offerings for the world-wide 

construction market. Our customers are demanding innovation and, based on TriMark’s continued growth 

in this market, we are delivering access solutions for the real world. 

 

We invite you to check out our website at www.trimarkcorp.com  to see why TriMark is the leading global 

door solution provider offering Global Reach, Global Support and Global Supply of access door systems.  

TriMark EVENTS 

TriMark News! 
For more information, please contact emarketing@trimarkcorp.com 

LATCHES         HANDLES         LINKAGES          HINGES          ELECTRONICS         LOCKS/KEYS 

http://www.trimarkcorp.com
mailto:emarketing@trimarkcorp.com
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=20&topcategoryid=3
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=11&topcategoryid=3
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=153&topcategoryid=3
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=18&topcategoryid=3
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=174&topcategoryid=3
https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/zCategory.aspx?intcategoryid=210&topcategoryid=3


Thanks to all that stopped by, it was our privilege to meet you and share the latest Access Hardware 

products that TriMark has to offer. If you didn't get a chance to attend the show or stop by our booth...... 

https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/salesliterature.aspx 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Here’s a Summary of What You Missed! 

 

TriMark’s Integrated Access Systems 
 

Designing and implementing a full door system solution requires a wide range of high-quality products 
working together to form a rugged, reliable system. We have on-display six popular access systems that 
range from compartment door products up to several full personnel door solutions that set the standard in 
excellence, design and value in the field. 
 

 

TriMark’s Modular Pull/Push Button Handle Product Families 
 

Introducing TriMark’s Modular Family of Pull and Push Button Handles.  Providing the same mounting and 
space claim, OEM’s can now offer different levels of features within a Pull or Push-Button Product. 
Ranging from a basic mechanical handle, up to a full e-LOCK Handle with capacitive sense, both families 
offer good/better/best functionality. 

 

TriMark’s Powered Products 
 

TriMark’s Powered Products adds further functionality and convenience to your access door and cabs. 
Several products are available that range from simple power lock actuators to complete powered door and 
window opening/ closing systems. 

https://www.trimarkcorp.com/en/salesliterature.aspx


 
 

TriMark’s e-ASK Keyless Entry Systems 
 

TriMark’s e-ASK keyless entry systems adds further functionality, convenience, productivity and security to 
your Access Door System. Your choice of several systems and components can provide ‘state of the art’ 
automotive style passive keyless entry and keyless push button start or basic lock/unlock. Additional 
functionality includes the control of compartment doors and hoods, windows, ignition, lighting, pneumatics, 
hydraulics, horns and sirens plus other security systems. 
 

 

TriMark’s Compression Latch Solutions 
 

TriMark has several 'off the shelf' Compression Latches that are designed to provide consistent gasket 
compression for vibration dampening and elimination of rattle and noise. Models range from light duty 
panel latches up to heavy duty latches designed and tested for demanding work environments and high 
vibrational loads. 
 

 

TriMark’s Hinges 
 

TriMark designs and manufactures standard and custom hinges for world leading companies in the 
agricultural, construction, transportation and specialty vehicle markets. Our experience and capabilities 
allow us to produce industrial hinges in plastic, die cast zinc, steel and stainless steel materials to suit light, 
medium and heavy duty applications. 
 

 

Looking Ahead  Visit TriMark at Agritechnica 

 
 

Agritechnica is a prime meeting place for innovators and major businesses in the agriculture machine and 

crop production market. After the cancellation of its previous edition due to Covid-19 pandemic, 

Agritechnica 2023 will mark a crucial industry reunion on 12 -18 November 2023 at Hannover Fairground. 

Over 400,000 visitors are expected to gather in Hannover for an unrivalled showcase of the latest 

innovations across the Agricultural Industry.  

 

 



About TriMark 

TriMark, celebrating its 50th Anniversary in 2021, is an employee-owned company and is a recognized leader in the design and 

manufacture of quality hardware products for the agricultural, construction, truck, bus, recreational vehicle, power sports, 

specialty vehicle and armored vehicle markets. 

 

TriMark is one of the world's leading innovators, designers, and manufacturers of vehicle door hardware. TriMark offers a 

comprehensive selection of handles, latches, linkages, hinges and complete door access systems including mechatronics for 

keyless entry and vehicle security.  

 

The TriMark corporate headquarters is located in New Hampton, Iowa, USA. TriMark serves the China market through TriMark 

Xuzhou and the European market through its subsidiary, TriMark Europe Ltd, based at Bardon Hill, near Coalville, Leicester. 

TriMark has been a valued partner supplier to Caterpillar for more than 45 years, in addition to other customers, including 

PACCAR, John Deere, AGCO, CNH, Harley-Davidson, Knapheide, Polaris, Oshkosh and Doosan (Bobcat), who provide world 

class vehicles and equipment.  

 

For 50 years, TriMark has been recognized as a true partner while building a global reputation for providing customers precisely 

the systems solutions they require.  

 

Learn more about TriMark  
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